

HUNT COUNTY

BID AWARD

FORMAL BID NO. 238-23, ASPHALT HOT AND COLD MIX

Effective 9/24/23 - 9/23/24

18,375

at 1:30 o'clock on SEP 26 2023

By BECKY LANDRUM
County Clerk, Hunt County, Tex.

PRECINCT	VENDOR	HOT MIX PRICE PER TON DELIVERED	HOT MIX PRICE PER TON PICKED UP	COLD MIX PRICE PER TON DELIVERED	COLD MIX PRICE PER TON PICKED UP	PICK - UP POINT	ALLOW GOV. ENTITIES PIGGYBACK
One	RK Hall, LLC	\$91.00	\$85.00	\$88.00	\$82.00	Hwy 224, Greenville, TX	YES
One	Richard Drake Construction Co. L.P.	\$121.80	\$98.80	\$116.80	\$93.80	221 CR 12530, Paris TX 75462	YES
One	Austin Asphalt	\$96.90	\$84.90	\$149.90	\$139.00	Farmersville Plant #405 - 2315 East Audie Murphy Parkway, Farmersville, TX 75422	YES
One	Unique Paving Materials Corp.	NO BID	NO BID	\$148.48	\$118.00	Martin Merietta Materials, 1795 TX-101 Bridgeport, TX 76426	NO
One	Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC.	NO BID	NO BID	**SEE PRICING BELOW	**SEE PRICING BELOW	FM 1022/Hwy 90 West, Dabney, TX	NO
Two	RK Hall, LLC	\$91.00	\$85.00	\$88.00	\$82.00	Hwy 224, Greenville, TX	YES
Two	Richard Drake Construction Co. L.P.	\$119.50	\$91.00	\$114.50	\$93.80	221 CR 12530, Paris TX 75462	YES
Two	Austin Asphalt	\$94.90	\$84.90	\$149.00	\$139.00	Farmersville Plant #405 - 2315 East Audie Murphy Parkway, Farmersville, TX 75422	YES
Two	Unique Paving Materials Corp.	NO BID	NO BID	\$146.56	\$118.00	Martin Merietta Materials, 1795 TX-101 Bridgeport, TX 76426	NO
Two	Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC	NO BID	NO BID	**SEE PRICING BELOW	**SEE PRICING BELOW	FM 1022/Hwy 90 West, Dabney, TX 78801	NO

HUNT COUNTY

BID AWARD

FORMAL BID NO. 238-23, ASPHALT HOT AND COLD MIX
Effective 9/24/23 - 9/23/24

Three	RK Hall, LLC	\$91.00	\$85.00	\$88.00	\$82.00	Hwy 224, Greenville, TX	YES
Three	Richard Drake Construction Co. L.P.	\$119.70	\$91.00	\$114.70	\$93.80	221 CR 12530, Paris TX 75462	YES
Three	Austin Asphalt	\$99.90	\$84.90	\$154.00	\$139.00	Farmersville Plant #405 - 2315 East Audie Murphy Parkway, Farmersville, TX 75422	YES
Three	Unique Paving Material Corp.	NO BID	NO BID	\$151.12	\$118.00	Martin Merietta Materials, 1795 TX-101 Bridgeport, TX 76426	NO
Three	Vulcan Construction Material, LLC	NO BID	NO BID	**SEE PRICING BELOW	**SEE PRICING BELOW	FM 1022/Hwy 90 West, Dabney, TX 78801	NO
FOUR	RK Hall, LLC	\$91.00	\$85.00	\$88.00	\$82.00	Hwy 224, Greenville, TX	YES
FOUR	Richard Drake Construction Co. L.P.	\$115.40	\$98.80	\$110.30	\$93.80	221 CR 12530, Paris TX 75462	YES
FOUR	Austin Asphalt	\$99.90	\$84.90	\$154.00	\$139.00	Farmersville Plant #405 - 2315 East Audie Murphy Parkway, Farmersville, TX 75422	YES
FOUR	Unique Paving Material Corp.	NO BID	NO BID	\$151.84	\$118.00	Martin Merietta Materials, 1795 TX-101 Bridgeport, TX 76426	NO
FOUR	Vulcan Construction Material, LLC	NO BID	NO BID	**SEE PRICING BELOW	**SEE PRICING BELOW	FM 1022/Hwy 90 West, Dabney, TX 78801	NO

HUNT COUNTY

BID AWARD

FORMAL BID NO. 238-23, ASPHALT HOT AND COLD MIX

Effective 9/24/23 - 9/23/24

****Vulcan Construction Materials LLC**

Celeste, TX - Delivered Price TYDS+ \$166.58 & TYD+ \$168.58 Pickup TYDS+ \$70.00 & TYD+ \$72.00 Fuel surcharge will be applied to haul rate (rate is \$96.58)
Caddo Mills, TX - Delivered Price TYDS+ \$162.18 & TYD+ \$164.18 Pickup TYDS+ \$70.00 & TYD+ \$72.00 Fuel surcharge will be applied to haul rate (rate is \$92.18)
Lone Oak, TX - Delivered Price TYDS+ \$163.94 & TYD+ \$165.94 Pickup TYDS+ \$70.00 & TYD+ \$72.00 Fuel surcharge will be applied to haul rate (rate is \$93.94)
Commerce, TX - Delivered Price TYDS+ \$167.90 & TYD+ \$169.90 Pickup TYDS+ \$70.00 & TYD+ \$72.00 Fuel surcharge will be applied to haul rate (rate is \$97.90)

****Austin Asphalt**

Precinct 1, 2, 3 and 4 - Asphalt mix available during normal plant operating hours - Hot Mix TxDot 340 spec-Type D/ Cold Mix TxDot 9202 spec.
Hot Mix B34 340 spec Type D -Cold Mix TxDOT 9202 spec. -Please see Trucking Rates/Guidelines that may apply for less than 3 Rounds - A day per truck for delivery.

****Unique Paving Materials Corp.**

Precinct 1, 2, 3 and 4 - Additional Pricing *UPM® High Performance Cold Mix*

The Purchasing Department recommends the award of this bid to all bidders in accordance with LGC\$262-027 (e)